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Gina Mouser

From: Vern Crawford [vacrawford@msn.com]

Sent:  Tuesday, July 07, 2009 8:42 AM

To: Karen Sides

Subject: Fw: Driver Ed Revenues - "Slosberg" court fees

----- Original Message -—--
From: Eric Stern

To: vacrawford@msn.com
Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2009 11:13 AM

Subject: RE: Driver Ed Revenues - "Slosberg" court fees

Mr. Crawford,

We receive Slosberg Funds from the County Commissioners office in quarterly
payments. This year we received from July - September $237,276, from October -
December $247,599 and from January - March $273,303. We have not received the
April - June payment. We receive 93% of the monies collected.

The School District of Palm Beach County receives the funds and then transfers the
money to the Safety Council of Palm Beach through our purchasing department. The
school district provides curriculum instruction fort our students and the Safety Council
provides the behind the wheel driving.

The monies are used by the safety Council for driver salaries, gasoline costs,
purchasing new vehicles, maintenance of existing vehicles, insurance and liability
coverage.

This year the school district has collected $758,178 and has held back 10% to
upgrade technology and curriculum in our classrooms. Due to budgetary constraints
and the cancellation of driver education being offered for summer school we are using
the 10% to hire school district teachers to keep the summer program alive.

If you need more information or have some questions then please call me on my cell
phone 561-629-6820.

Eric Stern

From: vacrawford@msn.com [mailto:vacrawford@msn.com]
Sent: Monday, May 18, 2009 7:39 PM

To: Eric Stern

Subject: Re: Driver Ed Revenues - "Slosberg" court fees

Thanks.

Vernon A. Pickup-Crawford
Schoolhouse Consulting Group, Inc.
(561) 644-2439 (ofc/cell)

11/4/2009
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vacrawford@msn.com

From: "Eric Stern”

Date: Mon, 18 May 2009 19:36:30 -0400

To: <vacrawford@msn.com>

Subject: Re: Driver Ed Revenues - "Slosberg" court fees

This will be a priority tomorrow.

From: Vern Crawford <vacrawford@msn.com>

To: Eric Stern

Sent: Mon May 18 15:59:42 2009

Subject: Re: Driver Ed Revenues - "Slosberg" court fees

Thanks. I think Todd is on a relatively tight timeline...the second part is not only how much but
also for what....

thanks.

----- Original Message -----

From: Eric Stern

To: vacrawford@msn.com

Sent: Monday, May 18, 2009 3:53 PM

Subject: Re: Driver Ed Revenues - "Slosberg" court fees

| will speak directly to our finance person Mark Fischer and respond accordingly.

From: Vern Crawford <vacrawford@msn.com>

To: Eric Stern

Cc: Todd J. Bonlarron <tbonlarr@co.palm-beach.fl.us>

Sent: Mon May 18 15:47:58 2009

Subject: Driver Ed Revenues - "Slosberg" court fees

Eric, Todd is head of the County Commission's legislative affairs and is asking status of
revenues we get (got) through the court fee established by former Rep. Irv Slosberg a while
back. He's doing a wrap on the state legislative season...any update on amount this fiscal year
and for what the fees were used for? I left a couple messages on your office phone today so
please either get back to me or use this email to provide the information directly to Todd.

Many thanks,

Vern

(561) 644-2439

----------------------------------------- Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If
you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a public records request, do not
send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, contact this office by phone or in writing.
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